**% ATTACHMENTS***




\. &’5

mo. 57 - 17 - 18. By Alderpersons Wolf, Draughon, and Donohue.

February 5, 2018.

AN ORDINANCE repealing and recreating various sections of the
Municipal Code so as to further implement the provisions of Res. 141-16-17
implementing changes to the City of Sheboygan committee, commission, and
board structure, effective April 2017 and April 2018.

THE COMMON COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SHEBOYGAN DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 1-16 of the Municipal Code entitled “Suspension
and revocation of licenses and permits” is hereby repealed and recreated
in subsection (b) (2) thereof to read as follows:

“Sec. 1-16. Suspension and revocation of licenses and permits.

(b) Except as otherwise specifically prescribed by this Code, the
procedure for revocation of any license, permit, or registration
issued in accordance with this Code shall be as follows:

(2) The licensee shall be given notice of the reasons for the
suspension or revocation and an opportunity to be heard
before the common council or the licensing, hearings, and
public safety committee for the purpose of determining
whether such suspension shall be imposed or whether the
license shall be revoked. Upon sworn, written complaint of
any city resident filed with the city clerk alleging that a
person holding a license under this Code has violated this
Code, the common council or the committee may issue a
summons signed by the clerk and directed to any peace
officer in the city. The summons shall command the licensee
or permittee complained of to appear before the common
council or committee on a day and place named in the
summons, not less than three days and not more than ten
days from the date of issuance, and show cause why his
license should not be revoked or suspended. The -summons and
a copy of the complaint shall be served on the licensee at
least three days before the time at which the licensee is
commanded to appear. Service shall be in the manner
provided under W.S.A. § 801.01 et seq., for service in
civil actions in circuit court.



Secti
committees

“Sec.

(a)

(b)

(c)

on 2. Section 2-72 of the Municipal Code entitled “Standing
” is hereby repealed and recreated to read as follows:

2-72. Standing committees.

The following standing committees of the council shall be
appointed by the mayor, subject to confirmation of the council,
on the third Tuesday of April of each year, or as soon
thereafter as may be possible:

(1) Finance and personnel committee; five aldermen.

(2) Licensing, hearings, and public safety committee; five
aldermen.

(3) Public works committee; five aldermen.

Each alderman shall be appointed to at least one but not more
than two of the standing committees. Each committee shall
consist of five members, which shall include a chairman and a
vice-chairman. The chairman and vice-chairman for each committee
shall be designated by the mayor. No alderman shall chair more
than one committee.

A quorum for each committee shall consist of three members.”

Section 3. Section 2-558 of the Municipal Code entitled
“Composition; appointment; terms” 1is hereby repealed and recreated in
subsection (a) thereof to read as follows:

“Sec.

(a)

2-558. Composition; appointment; terms.

The transit commission shall consist of nine commissioners. Six
of the members shall be the mayor, a member of the finance and
personnel committee of the common council, a member of the
licensing, hearings, and public safety committee of the common
council, a member of the public works committee of the common
council, the chief of ©police and the director of city
development, who shall be members by virtue of their office. The
other commissioners shall be three citizen members.

”



Section 4. Section 10-103 of the Municipal Code entitled “Retail

“Class B” Licenses” 1is hereby repealed and recreated in subsection (g)
thereof to read as follows:

“Sec. 10-103. - Retail “Class B” licenses.

(g) The fee for an initial issuance of a reserve “Class B” license,
as defined in §125.51(4)(a)4, Stats., shall be $10,000.00,
except that the fee for an initial issuance of a reserve "“Class
B” license to a bona fide <club or 1lodge situated and
incorporated in Wisconsin for at 1least six years is the fee
established under section 10-104 for such a club or lodge. The
fee under this subsection is in addition to any other fee
required under this chapter. The annual fee for renewal of a
reserved “Class B” license, as defined in §125.51(4) (a)4, Stats.
is the fee established in subsection (d) above.

"

Section 5. Section 18-1 of the Municipal Code entitled “Adoption of
state law provisions; abatement orders” is hereby repealed and recreated
in subsection (b) thereof to read as follows:

“Sec. 18-1. - Adoption of state law provisions; abatement orders.

(b) Abatement orders.

(1) The licensing, hearings, and public safety committee of the
common council is hereby designated and authorized,
pursuant to W.S.A., § 173.03(2), to affirm, modify, or
withdraw abatement orders issued under W.S.A., § 173.11, by
any humane officer or law enforcement officer.

(2) Any person named in an abatement order may appeal such
order to the 1licensing, hearings, and public safety
committee within ten days of service of the order. The
notice of appeal shall be served upon the city clerk and
must state the grounds for the appeal with specificity. The
licensing, hearings, and public safety committee shall
schedule a hearing to be held within ten days of the
receipt of the notice of appeal, unless the appellant
agrees to a later date. The licensing, hearings, and public
safety committee shall make reasonable efforts to notify



the appellant, the officer issuing the abatement order, and
any other interested party of the hearing and the
opportunity to present evidence and testimony at the
hearing. The hearing shall be informal in nature. Within
ten days after the hearing, the licensing, hearings, and
public safety committee shall determine whether to affirm,
modify and affirm, or withdraw the abatement order and
shall issue their decision in writing and serve it upon the
appellant and other interested parties.

(3) Any person adversely affected by a decision under
subsection (2) may seek judicial review by commencing an
action in circuit court within 30 days after the date of
the decision.”

Section 6. Section 18-47 of the Municipal Code entitled ™“Dangerous
and vicious dogs” is hereby repealed and recreated in subsection (i) (3)
thereof to read as follows:

“Sec. 18-47. Dangerous and vicious dogs.

(i) Declaration of vicious or dangerous dog; notification and
hearing.

(3) The hearing shall be held within fifteen days of receipt of
the request for hearing before the licensing, hearings, and
public safety committee of the common council. The chief of
police shall serve the appellant with notice of such
hearing by mail or personal service at least ten days
before such hearing. Any interested party may present
evidence as to whether the dog is dangerous or vicious. At
such a hearing, the determination of the police officer
shall be termed an initial determination.

”
.

Section 7. Section 26-46 of the Municipal Code entitled "“Vacant
building registration” is hereby repealed and recreated in subsection (h)
thereof to read as follows:

“Sec. 26-46. Vacant building registration.



(h)

Charge for public safety services. Any property owner or entity
functioning as a trustee of an owner that fails to comply with
any provision of this section shall be charged for any public
safety services rendered to the property by the police
department or fire department while noncompliant with this
section. The city shall charge the cost thereof to the owner
and, upon notice to the owner, such cost shall be assessed
against the real estate as a special charge. Appeal of any
determination of the chief of police or fire chief imposing
costs against the owner may be submitted for a hearing to the
licensing, hearings, and public safety committee of the common
council. Chapter 68 of the Wisconsin Statutes shall not apply to
such an appeal.”

Section 8. Section 30-64 of the Municipal Code entitled “Revocation”
is hereby repealed and recreated in subsection (b) thereof to read as

follows:

“Sec. 30-64. Revocation.

(b)

Notification of licensee or permit holder; right of hearing. No
license and/or user’s permit shall be revoked until a written
notice 1is received by the licensee or permit holder from the
chief of police. Those so notified shall then have ten days to
request, in writing, a hearing before the next meeting of the
licensing, hearings, and public safety committee, who shall then
rule on the revocation request by the chief of police or his
authorized representative.

”

.

Section 9. Section 50-630 of the Municipal Code entitled “Breach of
agreement; cessation of service” 1is hereby repealed and recreated in
subsection {c) thereof to read as follows:

“Sec. 50-630. Breach of agreement; cessation of service.

(c)

Notice of disconnection/cessation of services. No monitoring
service shall be disconnected or agreement declared severable
until a written notice sent by certified letter is received by
the alarm user from the supervisor of the city public safety
communications center. A person so notified shall then have 14



days to request in writing a hearing before the next meeting of
the licensing, hearings, and public safety committee, who shall

rule on the request by the supervisor of the city public safety
communications center.

&’
. . .

Section 10. Section 54-73 of the Municipal Code entitled
“Appointment of adult school crossing guards” 1is hereby repealed and
recreated in subsection (c¢) (4) thereof to read as follows:

“Sec. 54-73. Appointment of adult school crossing guards.

(c) Conditions of employment. All school crossing guards shall be
employed subject to the following conditions:

(4) The chief of police shall assign school crossing guards to
such localities as shall be best suited to afford
protection to those persons attending school in the city.

I{4

Section 11. Section 66-154 of the Municipal Code entitled “Appeal”
is hereby repealed and recreated to read as follows:

“Sec. 66-154. Appeal.

Appeal of any determination of the chief of police pursuant to this
article may be submitted for a hearing to the licensing, hearings,
and public safety committee of the common council. Wis. Stats. Ch. 68
shall not apply to such an appeal.”

Section 12. Section 70-265 of the Municipal Code entitled “Appeal”
is hereby repealed and recreated to read as follows:

“Sec. 70-265. Appeal.

(a) The above 1,500-foot requirements may be waived upon approval of
the licensing, hearings, and public safety committee through appeal by the
affected party. Such appeal shall be made in writing to the city clerk's
office, who shall forward the request to the common council for referral
to the committee, which shall receive reports from the police department
on such appeal. The committee shall convene and consider the public



interest as well as the affected party’s presentation and concerns. After
deliberation, the committee shall forward its decision in writing via the
minutes or otherwise to the City of Sheboygan Police Chief for their

information and action. A written copy of the decision shall be provided
to the affected party.

(b) The committee may reject a waiver request when the request is
filed with the city clerk’s office within 90 days of denial by the
committee of a prior identical waiver request of the requester, absent a
change in circumstances.”

Section 13. Section 110-504 of the Municipal Code entitled
“Revocation; penalties” is hereby repealed and recreated in subsection (a)
thereof to read as follows:

“Sec. 110-504. Revocation; penalties.

(a) A sidewalk café permit may be revoked by the common council,
prior to expiration, upon notice to the holder of an opportunity
to be heard on the matter, as a result of any violation of the
provisions of this article or of violation of the provisions of
any city ordinance or state or federal statute relating to
activity occurring within the sidewalk café. Said hearing shall
be before the licensing, hearings, and public safety committee
of the common council.

”
.

Section 14. Section 138-13 of the Municipal Code entitled
“Suspension or revocation” is hereby repealed and recreated in subsection
(c) thereof to read as follows:

“Sec. 138-13. Suspension or revocation.

(c) Hearings. The hearings provided for in this section shall be
conducted by the licensing, hearings, and public safety
committee at a time and place designated by the committee
chairperson. Based upon the record of such hearing, the building
inspection department shall be charged with enforcing the
decisions of the committee with the assistance of such other
government official as necessary. A written report of the
hearing decision shall be furnished to the license holder by the
committee chairperson.”



Section 15. All ordinances or parts thereof in conflict with the
provisions of this ordinance are hereby repealed to the extent of such
conflict, and this ordinance shall be in effect from and after its passage
and publication and as of April 17, 2018.

& 5

. 5 é /’ \/’

vy

() U

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing Ordinance was duly passed by the
Common Council of the City of Sheboygan, Wisconsin, on the day of
: 20 .

Dated 20 4 7 City Clerk

Approved 20 - , Mayor




g & L4

Gen. Ord. No. Egg - 17 - 18. By Alderpersons Draughon and Sorenson.
February 5, 2018.

AN ORDINANCE amending Section 26-36 and 26-37 of the Municipal Code
so as to update the adoption of various uniform and building codes.

THE COMMON COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SHEBOYGAN DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 26-36 of the Municipal Code entitled "“Building
code adopted” is repealed and recreated in subsection (a) thereof so as to
read as follows:

“Sec. 26-36. Building code adopted.

(a) The Wisconsin Uniform Building Code, as amended in 2009,
prepared by the Building Inspectors' Association of Southeastern
Wisconsin, is hereby adopted by reference as the city's building
code with the exception of the following sections: Section
30.20(3) of chapter 3; section 30.06(2) and (3) of chapter 2;
and section 30.40 of chapter 5.

"

Section 2. Section 26-37 of the Municipal Code entitled “Uniform
codes adopted” is repealed and recreated in subsection (a) thereof so as
to read as follows:

“Sec. 26-37. Uniform codes adopted.

(a) Generally. The following, including all appendixes and all
amendments thereto, are adopted and incorporated in this Code by
reference, except as specifically provided in this chapter:

(1) Chapters SPS 316, 320-325, 360—366, 367 and 381—-387, Wis.
Admin. Code.

(2) The International Property Maintenance Code, as adopted in
2009, except:

a. The following sections and subsections are
specifically excluded:
L Subsection 102.3;

2 . Section 103;
3 Section 111;
4 Section 303;
5 Subsection 304.3;

el



6.
7.

Subsection 307.3.1;
Subsection 307.3.2;

The following sections and subsections are modified as
set forth below:

1.

Section 301.2 is modified to provide as follows:
“No person, shall use, occupy, own, or permit use
of any structure or premises that does not comply
with the requirements of this Code.”

Subsection 304.7 is modified to provide as
follows: “All roofs shall be structurally sound,
tight and have no defects which might admit rain.
Roof drainage shall be adequate to prevent
rainwater from causing dampness in the walls or
interior portion of the building. Existing
gutters and downspouts shall be maintained in
good repair, and direct water away from all
foundations. All dwellings nearer than three feet
to property line shall have gutters and
downspouts installed on the entire affected
side.”

In addition to the requirements of subsection
304.13, window panes and doors which require
glazing shall not be boarded up except as a
result of weather conditions or replacement and
then only on a temporary basis, not to exceed
three weeks. Commercial buildings shall comply
with the requirements of subsection 26-651(e) of
this Code.

Subsection 304.14 is modified to provide that
screens shall be required between May 1 and
October 15.

Subsection 304.18.1 is modified to provide as
follows: “Doors providing access to a dwelling
unit, rooming unit, rooming unit or housekeeping
unit that is rented, leased, or 1let shall be
equipped with a 1lock designed to be readily
openable from the side from which egress is to be

made  without the need for keys, special
knowledge, or effort. Such locks shall be
installed according to the manufacturer's

specifications and maintained in good working
order.”

Subsection 307.1 is modified to provide as
follows: “Every exterior and interior flight of
stairs having more than three risers shall have a
handrail on one side of the stair and every open



(3)

”

10.

11.

12.

portion of a stair, 1landing, balcony, porch,
deck, ramp or other walking surface more than 24
inches above the floor or grade below shall have
guards. Handrails shall not be 1less than 30
inches high or more than 38 inches high measured
vertically above the nosing of the tread or above
the finished floor of the 1landing or walking
surfaces. Guards shall not be less than 36 inches
high above the floor of the landing, balcony,
porch, deck, or ramp or other walking surface.
Exception: Existing handrail and guardrails in
good repair may remain per the code in effect at
the time of installation.”

Subsection 404.5 is modified to provide as
follows: “The number of persons occupying a
dwelling unit shall not create conditions that,
in the opinion of the code official, endanger the
life, health, safety or welfare of the occupants.
Every room occupied for sleeping purposes shall
contain at least 70 square feet of floor space
and shall contain at least 50 square feet of
floor space for each occupant over 12 years of
age and 25 square feet of floor space for each
occupant 12 years of age or under.”

The final sentence of subsection 505.1 is
modified to provide as follows: “All kitchen
sinks, lavatories, laundry facilities, bathtubs
and showers shall be supplied with hot or
tempered and cold running water in accordance
with provisions of the Wisconsin Administrative
Code.”

Subsection 602.3 is modified to provide that it
is effective between September 1 and May 31 and
so as to replace the reference to Appendix D of
the International Plumbing Code with SPS
322.07(2). Wis. Admin. Code.

Subsection 602.4 is modified to provide that it
is effective between September 1 and May 31.
Subsection 603.2 is modified to eliminate the
exception.

Subsection 604.2 is modified to replace the
reference to the ICC Electric Code with SPS 316,
Wis. Admin. Code.

The International Building Code chapters 1-35.



Section 3. All ordinances or parts thereof in conflict with the
provisions of this ordinance are hereby repealed to the extent of such
conflict, and this ordinance shall be in effect from and after its passage
and publication.

I
Y/
”/?92/”/

Dsir Somen

ly

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing Ordinance was duly passed by the
Common Council of the City of Sheboygan, Wisconsin, on the day of
, 20 .

Dated 20 . , City Clerk

Approved 20 . , Mayor




CITY OF SHEBOYGAN

REQUEST FOR PUBLIC SAFETY COMMITTEE CONSIDERATION

ITEM DESCRIPTION: Report of Officer, submitting the Police Department Quarterly Report for
the period commencing October 1, 2017 and ending December 31, 2017.

REPORT PREPARED BY: Christopher Domagalski, Chief of Police

REPORT DATE: February 8, 2018 MEETING DATE: February 14, 2018
FISCAL SUMMARY: STATUTORY REFERENCE:
Budget Line Item: N/A Wisconsin Statutes: N/A
Budget Summary: N/A Municipal Code: Sec. 54-65
Budgeted Expenditure: N/A
Budgeted Revenue: N/A

BACKGROUND / ANALYSIS:

The Quarterly Report of Benchmarks for the Police Department for the Period commencing
October 1, 2017 and ending December 31, 2017 is presented for information and discussion
as required by section 54-65 of the Municipal Code.

STAFF COMMENTS:

Highlights of the report are as follows:

e Overall Part 1 Crimes decreased by 20% year to date in comparison to the same period
in 2016 (957 vs. 1199), including a 15% decrease in aggravated assaults, a 33%
decrease in thefts and a 24% decrease in burglaries.

e Traffic accidents decreased year to date (1,736 vs.1,900) in correlation with the directed
seat belt enforcement initiatives that have been deployed in high accident corridors.
These deployments are also responsible for the 31% increase in traffic stops during the
year to date period.

e There has been a 6% increase in parking tickets in comparison to 2016. This continues to
look promising going forward as we have transitioned one of the full time Community
Service Officer positions to part time equivalent employees.

e The year finished with a 9% increase in involuntary commitments for the year in
comparison to 2016. Down from the 26% increase that we were trending earlier in the
year. This continues to be concerning because of the large number of resources
consumed by these calls.

ACTION REQUESTED:
Motion to recommend to Council to Approve the Report of Officer No. 279 —17 - 18.

ATTACHMENTS:
I. R.O No. 279-17-18



2,

0. No. &7@ - 17 - 18. By CHIEF OF POLICE CHRISTOPHER DOMAGALSKI.
February 5, 2018.

Pursuant to section 54-65 of the Municipal Code, I herewith submit my
quarterly report showing the Benchmark Measurements for my department for

the period commencing October 1, 2017 and ending December 31, 2017.

2015 Y-T=D 2016 Y=T=D 2017
Patrol and Investgations Actual 12/31/16 Actual 12/31/17 Goals
Homicide 0 1 1 0 0
Rape 22 20 20 24 10
Robbery 14 10 10 il 15
Aggravated Assualt 124 100 100 85 90
Violent Crime Total 160 131 131 120 125
Burglary 128 119 119 91 115
Theft 991 g08 908 702 900
Motor Vehicle Theft 31 36 36 32 30
Arson 4 5 5 12 5
Property Crime Total 1154 1068 1068 837 1050
Percent of Offenses Cleared 53 % 55% 55 % BO% 70 %
Value of Property Stolen $510, 385 $497,952 $497,952 $554,070 $500,000
Value of Property Recovered $143,730 $204,714 $204,714 $184,216 $200,000
Percent of Stolen Recovered 28 % 41% 41 % 33% 40 %
Accident Investigations 1,698 1,900 1,900 1,736 1,500
Traffic Stops N/A 4,234 4,234 6,157 No goal
Traffic Arrests 2,337 2,426 2,426 4,669 No Goal
Other Arrests 3,861 3,692 3,692 2,959 No Goal
Speed Trailer Deployments N/A 12 12 7 20
HVEE Deployments N/A 16 N/A 6 12
Parking Tickets Issued 8,745 9,842 9,842 10,476 10,000
Bicycles Recovered 212 200 139 150
Involuntary Commitments 108 148 161 No Goal
Administration
District Attorney Request
for Digital Evidence 2,612 N/A N/A 1,008 2,750
Open Records Requests 4,335 4,310 3,778 4,000
Nixle Messages Sent 219 N/A 263 250
Press Releases N/A N/A 25 50
Tweets 311 N/A 298 350
Facebook likes 3000 6,000 8,045 9,000
Reported Crime Maps 104 104 100 104
Crime Comparison Reports 52 52 43 52
Burglary Reports 86 86 a7 86

CHIEF OF POLICE



( Z. 10

289
R.O. No. -17 -18 By FIRE CHIEF. February 5, 2018.

Pursuant to section 50-564 of the Municipal Code, | herewith submit my quarterly report of
Benchmark Measurements for the Fire Department, for the period commencing October 1, 2017
and ending December 31, 2017.

4th 4th

2015 Quarter 2016 Quarter 2017
Incident Types Actual 1213117 Actual 12/31/17 Goals
Fires 141 36 138 25 125
Rescue & Emergency Medical Service 3,902 968 3,931 997 3,900
Non Fires 991 249 938 249 910
TOTAL 5,034 1,253 5,007 1,271 5,000
Station Incident Count Per Station
Station 1 1,542 382 1,507 374 1,500
Station 2 915 224 965 234 950
Station 3 1,205 315 1,212 333 1,200
Station 4 813 210 785 195 750
Station 5 532 113 509 124 500
Out of City 27 9 29 11 20
Fire Loss
Number of Incidents 59 18 72 10 20
Total Property Loss $ 523,850 $ 403,050 3 846,192 $ 15,100 3 750,000
Total Content Loss $ 379,305 $ 130,925 % 312,690 $ 2,681 3 250,000
Total Loss $ 903,155 $ 533,975 $ 1,158,882 $ 17,781 $ 1,000,000
Average Loss $ 15,307 $ 29,665 $ 16,095 $ 1,778 $ 15,000
Workload
Inspections 1,835 - 1,860 - 1,880
School Safety Programs 182 - 183 - 185
Training Hours 8,282 9,566 10,000
Investigations/Formal 141/15 138/10 125/10
Efficiency
EMS Average Response Time (Seconds) 240 - - - - 90%
Fire Average Response Time (Seconds) 300 - - - - 90%
Effectiveness
Resident Satisfaction Rating - - - 98% - 85%
ISO Rating 2 2 2 2 2 2

. \Srl(’ = FIRE CHIEF
' &



CITY OF SHEBOYGAN

REQUEST FOR PUBLIC SAFETY COMMITTEE CONSIDERATION

ITEM DESCRIPTION: Report of Officer, submitting the Fire Department Quarterly Report for
the period commencing October 1, 2017 and ending December 31, 2017.

REPORT PREPARED BY: Michael T. Romas, Fire Chief

REPORT DATE: January 29, 2018 MEETING DATE: February 5, 2018
FISCAL SUMMARY: STATUTORY REFERENCE:

Budget Line Item: N/A Wisconsin Statutes: N/A

Budget Summary: N/A Municipal Code: Sec. 50-564

Budgeted Expenditure: N/A
Budgeted Revenue: N/A

BACKGROUND / ANALYSIS:

The Quarterly Report of Benchmarks for the Fire Department for the Period commencing October 1,
2017 and ending December 31, 2017 is presented for information and discussion as required by
section 50-564 of the Municipal code.

STAFF COMMENTS:
Highlights of the 2017 fourth quarter report are as follows:

e 44% decrease in fire loss incidents
o 22to 16

o 94% decrease average fire loss dollars
o $29,665 to $1,778
¢ Run volume, station responses and out of city responses are almost identical

ACTION REQUESTED:
Motion to recommend to Council to Approve the Report of Officer No. -17-18.

ATTACHMENTS: R.O. No. -17-18



4 9

Res. No. Lal-li - 18. By Alderperson Draughon. February 5, 2018.

A RESOLUTION authorizing the Purchasing Agent to enter into contract
for the complete replacement of the roof at Fire Station # 1.

WHEREAS; The roofing system at Fire Station Number 1 has exceeded its
expected useful life and is in need of replacement and;

WHEREAS; The Purchasing Agent solicited sealed bids from qualified
firms for the complete replacement of the roof as well as modification of
the ladder system used to access the roof in a safe manner. Three bids from
gqualified firms were received and the low bid from Walsdorf Roofing Inc. of
Kiel WI has been found to meet or exceed all of the specifications and;

WHEREAS; The funding for this project was included in the 2018 Capital
Improvements budget and also includes complete restoration of the exterior
masonry which will be handled through a separate bid issuance.

RESOLVED: That the Purchasing Agent is hereby authorized to enter into
contract with Walsdorf Roofing Inc. of Kiel WI in the amount of $ 93,707.00
as per bid # 1935-18 dated January 12, 2018

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED: That the appropriate City Officials are hereby
authorized to draw orders on 47722100-621200 2018 Capital Improvements Fund
account in the amount of $ 93,707.00

A j_,;*L .
/1A£\S(ijq/

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing Resolution was duly passed by the

Common Council of the City of Sheboygan, Wisconsin, on the day of
» 20 .
Dated 20 . , Bity Clerk

Approved 20 . , Mayor




37

R. 0. No. A75- 17 - 18. By CITY CLERK. February 5, 2018.

Submitting a communication from Michael W. Slinker requesting a waiver
from the Sex Offender Residency requirements in order to reside at a TLP at
either 1123/1125 North 14™ Street or 930A Michigan Avenue.

CITY CLERK

N G
i S



FEB 1'1811:44

1/31/18
Date:

—Mighael W —S5linker

My name is:

| am requesting a waiver to the Sexual Residency Requirements so | may live at:
TLP: 930 A Michigan Ave, Sheboygan WI 53081

or 1123 or 1125 N. 14th St, Sheboygan, WI 53081

Signature: W

Phone Number: I

//fﬁ% 50777%:// A’ga\ﬂl sl IS Fzer 279/~ 789t
SCpcr /y AL /7’?6@74/?

Any applications for a waiver from the Sex Offender Residency restrictions received by Noon on the Thursday
prior to the following Monday’s Council meeting will be submitted to that Council for referral to Public
Protection and Safety. Anything after Noon on Thursday will not go to Council until the next Council meeting.

This will allow the Police Department to complete the necessary work they do to prepare for the Public
Protection and Safety meeting.

Thank you for all your cooperation in the matter.




3.

R. Q. No. a?ﬁ%b = 1F = 1§, By CITY CLERK. February 5, 2018.

Submitting a communication from State of Wisconsin Department of
Corrections on behalf of Thomas Wirth requesting a waiver from the Sex
Offender Residency requirements in order to be placed at a TLP at either
1123/1125 North 14™ Street or 930A Michigan Avenue depending on availability.

.

\?J)hf “j&l(.c{v | CITY CLERK



Division of Community
Corrections

Probation & Parole

3422 Wilgus Avenue
Sheboygan, W1 53081

Scott Walker

Governor

Jon E. Litscher
Secretary . . Telephone (920) 459-3097
State of Wisconsin Facsimile (920) 459-4386

Department of Corrections

January 31, 2018
18 11:44
Re: City of Sheboygan Sex Offender Ordinance FEB 1'18 11

To whom it may concern:

The Department of Corrections is hereby filing an appeal to the Sex Offender Residency restrictions on behalf
of State inmate Thomas Wirth in order for Mr. Wirth to be placed at a Transitional Living Placement (TLP)
located at one of the following locations depending on availability: 930 A Michigan Ave., Sheboygan, W1
53081 or 1123 or 1125 N. 14th St., Sheboygan, W1 53081.

Respectfully,

i

Josh Butzen
Probation/Parole Agent 70802
(920) 918-7894



=1

R. 0. No. X V]- 17 - 1s. By CITY CLERK. February 5, 2018.

Submitting a communication from Phoenix Reyes requesting a waiver from
the Sex Offender Residency requirements in order to reside at 1123/1125 North
14™ Street or 930A Michigan Avenue.

e S84




FEB 1'18a411:44

Date: 8!&\\\’

My name is: r? \\QQ){W\N QJLL\\Q.S

| am requesting a waiver to the Sexual Residency Recix rements so | may live at:

\\9”\\\|90 i, fh S T aah &

G304 rhic ' G1n Ave Shl-bmm@ %)

Signature: l\JE‘A \2 &\"“ .,_LM Q\T\UL‘(\\)( QJ«.HA,-

Phone Number: Lq‘i)L\ (’ 8 8063&

Any applications for a waiver from the Sex Offender Residency restrictions received by Noon on the Thursday
prior to the following Monday’s Council meeting will be submitted to that Council for referral to Public
Protection and Safety. Anything after Noon on Thursday will not go to Council until the next Council meeting.

This will allow the Police Department to complete the necessary work they do to prepare for the Public
Protection and Safety meeting.

Thank you for all your cooperation in the matter.



58

R. O. No. 0?78— 17 ~ 18 By CITY CLERK. February 5, 2018.

Submitting a communication from Zachary Shane Carlin requesting a waiver
from the Sex Offender Residency requirements in order to reside at 910 New
York Avenue.

\ [dv
P i Cal/
{\DU;"D CITY CLERK

= v



Date: SANUPRY 23 72018 JAN30°18 a1 1:4S

Mynameis:_ZPCHARY SHANE CARCON

| am requesting a waiver to the Sexual Residency Requirements so | may live at:
910 NEW YoR ¥ puE EAS SHEROYGBN wrt D308 |

Signature: /M///%_/ W

&

Phone Number: 414 \- 308- 805

Any applications for a walver from the Sex Offender Residency restrictions received by Noon on the Thursday
prior to the following Monday’s Council meeting will be submitted to that Council for referral to Public
Protection and Safety. Anything after Noon on Thursday will not go to Council until the next Council meeting.

This will allow the Police Department to complete the necessary work they do to prepare for the Public
Protection and Safety meeting.

Thank you for all your cooperation in the matter.



AL

R. 8. No. CQSV - 17 = 18. By CITY CLERK. February 5, 2018.

Submitting a communication from Ernest Ramirez requesting a waiver from
the Sex Offender Residency requirements in order to reside at 1629 Georgia
Avenue.

)/ \ CITY CLERK
v



Jjan24a*18ex 1:27

Date:\J\Qﬁ. \Oﬁ.&O\B

e o

My name is: : £

| am requesting a waiver to the Sexual Residency Requirements so | may live at:

A C)ZQDQ‘\B Pt\ﬁ&

o
Signature M@O MU Ly,

Phone Number:,_ CA2.6) 954 - Sqqq

Any applications for a waiver from the Sex Offender Residency restrictions received by Noon on the Thursday
prior to the following Monday’s Council meeting will be submitted to that Council for referral to Public
Protection and Safety. Anything after Noon on Thursday will not go to Council until the next Council meeting.

This will aliow the Police Department to complete the necessary work they do to prepare for the Public
Protection and Safety meeting.

Thank you for all your cooperation in the matter.



~
."/
7 \

24

R. 0. No. 28— 17 - 1g. By CITY CLERK. February 5, 2018.

Submitting a communication from Vong Xiong requesting a waiver from the

Sex Offender Residency requirements in order to reside at 1432 North 10"
Street.

o~

S \ ] A\
; ’Il.l ..\ % 1 1"‘ b /
UUIC/ i \(' () CITY CLERK




JAN 2218 aM11:28

Date: \’)\_3 /\‘é‘

My nameis;___\) oo\ Aand
@) )

| am requesting a waiver to the Sexual Residency Requirements so | may live at:
22 KL O™ Sy
S\(\Q‘\l\(xk\x)ci‘of\ WT Fan]L

)

V 7
Phone Number: &~ ‘/// 479 =227 -W\2

Any applications for a walver from the Sex Offender Restdency restrictions recelved by Noon on the Thursday
prlor to the following Monday’s Council meeting will be submitted to that Council for referral to Public
Protection and Safety. Anything after Noon on Thursday will not go to Councll untli the next Councll meeting.

This will allow the Police Department to complete the nacessary work they do to prepare for the Public
Protection and Safety meeting.

Thank you for all your cooperation in the matter.



